



Sumner County Board of Education

Del R. Phillips III, Ph.D.

Director of Schools

695 East Main Street Gallatin, TN 37066-2472

Phone: (615) 451-5200 Fax: (615) 451-5216

Bid Minutes
20171129-BOE
Cafeteria Table

Sealed bids were opened on November 29, 2017 at 10:00 a.m. at the Larry Riggsbee Facilities Building, 1500 Airport Road, Gallatin, Tennessee for 20171129-BOE.

Present for the bid opening were:

| | |
|----------------|----------------------------------|
| Janice Wright | Sumner County Board of Education |
| Chris Harrison | Sumner County Board of Education |
| Lisa Kirkus | Ernie Morris Enterprises |
| Adam Cohen | Guy Brown Interiors |

Bid responses were received from the following companies:

Ernie Morris Enterprises
404 Concord Road
Lebanon, TN 37087

Douglas Food Stores
dba Douglas Equipment
776 McKenzie Drive
Dandridge, TN 37725

Guy Brown Interiors
7111 Commerce Way
Brentwood, TN 37027

School Outfitters
3736 Regent Avenue
Cincinnati, OH 45212

School Specialty Inc.
W6316 Design Drive
Greenville, WI 54942

J&N Enterprises Inc.
dba Commercial Concepts & Furnishings
3622 Noland Court
Independence, MO 64055

Board of Education Members

Sarah Andrews - Alice Bachman - Tim Brewer - David A. Brown - Patricia Brown - Jeff Cordell - Andy Daniels - Glen Gregory - Jim Hawkins - Tammy Hayes - Ted Wise

**SUMNER COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
 BID TABULATION
 20171129-BOE**

| | ITEM NO. 1 | | ITEM NO. 2 | | ITEM NO. 3 | | ITEM NO. 4 | |
|---|-------------------------------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------------------|--------------------------------|
| | Chrome Frame | Painted Frame | Chrome Frame | Painted Frame | Chrome Frame | Painted Frame | Chrome Frame | Painted Frame |
| Ernie Morris Enterprises AmTab Model No. | \$ 1,229.00 MST1212-DR-2715-CHRM | \$ 1,132.00 MST1212-DR-2715 | \$ 1,297.00 MST1216-DR-2513-CHRM | \$ 1,158.00 MST1216-DR-2513 | \$ 1,353.00 MST1212-DR-2715-CHRM | \$ 1,245.00 MST1212-DR-2715 | \$ 1,426.00 MST1216-DR-2715-CHRM | \$ 1,304.00 MST1216-DR-2513 |
| Douglas Equipment National Public Seating Model No. | \$ 1,288.64 MTS12-MDPEPC-27 | \$ 1,205.12 MTS12-MDPEPC-27 | \$ 1,596.55 MTS1216-MDPEPC | \$ 1,416.71 MTS1216-MDPEPC | \$ 1,565.87 MTS12-MDPEPC-27 | \$ 1,482.35 MTS12-MDPEPC-27 | \$ 1,844.41 MTS1216-MDPEPC | \$ 1,664.57 MTS1216-MDPEPC |
| Guy Brown Interiors SICO Model No. | \$ 1,474.55 TTR61D | \$ 1,400.82 TTR61D | \$ 1,600.50 TTP61B | \$ 1,520.48 TTP61B | \$ 1,518.79 TTR61D | \$ 1,442.85 TTR61D | \$ 1,648.52 TTP61B | \$ 1,566.64 TTP61B |
| School Outfitters Learniture Model No. | \$ 1,349.00 LNT-GNI3030 | \$ 1,129.00 - | \$ 1,559.00 LNT-GNI3019C | \$ 1,339.00 - | \$ 1,138.00 - | \$ 1,050.00 - | \$ 1,444.00 - | \$ 1,239.00 - |
| School Specialty Classroom Select | \$ 1,129.69 1433632 | \$ 1,055.28 1433636 | \$ 1,409.37 1440977 | \$ 1,249.48 1440981 | NO BID - | NO BID - | NO BID - | NO BID - |
| Commercial Concepts & Furnishings National Public Seating Model No. | \$ 1,133.83 MTS12-MDPECR | \$ 1,065.06 MTS12-MDPEPC | \$ 1,368.60 MTS1216-MDPECR | \$ 1,206.68 MTS1216-MDPEPC | \$ 1,536.61 MTS12-MDPECR | \$ 1,467.84 MTS12-MDPEPC | \$ 1,765.03 MTS1216-MDPECR | \$ 1,603.11 MTS1216-MDPEPC |